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RC FISHING TIPS 
 
  
Once you have learned the basic operation of The “RC FISHING 
POLE” you can probably think of other ways to fish using it. 
 
1. Add a bobber to your line and keep the line attached to the 
boat, watch as the bobber disconnects from the boat when a fish 
hits.   
 
2.  Once you line is at the spot you can give the line a gentle tug 
to release it from the boat so your line stays there, then bring the 
boat back. 
 
3.Set your bait high for weedy areas, tug the line off the boat 
when you find a good place. 
 
4, Try putting a spoon on and trolling with the boat. 
 
5. Try using a very small split-shot sinker on your fishing line to 
stick the soft connector to, that way your line depth won't change. 
 
6. Try using a small section of a regular drinking straw, about 1 
1/2” long and threading your line through it, and  

wrapping the soft connector to it. That way you can move your 
line depth up or down when you get the boat to your fishing spot 
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 THE CONCEPT OF RC FISHING 
  

DRIVE YOUR FISHING LINE TO THE FISH 
 

The “RC FISHING POLE” is designed to attach to most any Elec-
tric Remote Control boat. Most boats will work well, we recom-
mend one that  over 19-20 inches long. The bigger the boat the 
further you will be able to fish, and the bigger the boat the more 
options. 

 FITS ON ANY RC BOAT 
 

The ‘RC FISHING POLE” is also designed to be removable, 
there is also an extra set of holders included so you may inter-
change it between two boats if you want. 
 
Once the “RC FISHING POLE” is attached it becomes a part of 
your fishing rod, The difference is you attach your fishing line 
from your rod to the “RC FISHING POLE” . You then open the 
bail on  your rod like your going to cast and drive your line with 
the  Remote Controller . Once a fish hits the line automatically 
disconnects from the “RC FISHING POLE” and you reel the fish 
in with your regular fishing rod.  
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THE BOAT YOU USE 
 
This part contains Information about the boat you choose. 
 
You can use an Electric or a Gas Remote Control Boat.  
The advantage of an Electric boat is that you can stop it with the 
motor not running . We recommend an Electric Boat for that rea-
son, but a Gas boat will also work. You can also use a Hovercraft 
Boat for fishing in weedy areas, the motor is quieter too. 
 
When picking out a boat keep in mind the type of fishing you will 
be doing and the water conditions. The bigger boats  tend to be 
better in water, have a greater distance, and the batteries usually 
last longer.  We recommend that you use a boat over 19”, be-
cause there might be too much weight on the boat and it will not 
be balanced and can sink. Mounting The “RC FISHING POLE” 
on the middle of the boat keeps the boat better balanced. On big-
ger boats mounting The “ RC FISHING POLE” on the middle is 
not necessary, it can be mounted towards the rear. Some boats 
don’t have sides suitable to mount, so you can mount The “ RC 
FISHING POLE” on the deck, (top) of the boat.  
 
Another thing about boats is that since you are going to use the 
boat for fishing, you might want to make modifications to the boat 
that will make fishing better. One thing you could do is add a little  
silicone sealer around areas you think might leak. If you need a 
boat check out our website or call us.  
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 GENERAL OPERATION EXPLAINED 
 
 
1. The rough connector goes, (sticks) on the tip of The “RC 
FISHING POLE” The  soft connector is the one that goes onto 
your fishing line and gets folded over it. When you press the soft 
connector on, it will  stick to the rough connector, that is what  
holds your line to the boat. Only a slight amount is needed to 
hold it there, if your fishing for panfish you want to lightly to press 
it on.  
 
2. After baiting your hook, press the soft connector on your fish-
ing line onto the rough connector on the tip of The “RC FISHING 
POLE” 
 
3. Then open the caster ( bail ), on your fishing rod, like your go-
ing to cast it. Instead of casting it you use the Remote Controller 
that came with your boat to Drive your line where you want it. 
 
4. When you get the line where you want it close the cast setting 
in your Fishing Rod. Leave the  line on the Boat, or give it a gen-
tle tug to release it from the Boat. 
 
5. When a fish strikes your line it will automatically disconnect 
itself from the boat, then you reel it in with your Fishing Rod. 
 
6. After you reel in the fish, you can use the Remote Controller to 
bring you boat back to you. 
 
7. An extra set of holders is included, if you want to use the “RC 
POLE” on a different boat.. 
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  1.      THE HOLDERS 2 THE “RC FISHING 
POLE” 

3. ROUGH  
CONNECTORS 

4. SOFT  
CONNECTORS 
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   PARTS  IDENTIFICATION 
 
 
  1.      THE HOLDERS 
THE “HOLDERS” ATTACH TO THE REMOTE CONTROL  
BOAT.  THEY HAVE STICKY ADHESIVE ON THEM.  WHEN 
THE PAPER IS PEELED OFF THEY ARE APPLIED ONTO THE 
BOAT. THEY ARE FOR HOLDING THE “RC FISHING POLE” 
TO THE RC BOAT. 
 
  2.      THE “RC FISHING POLE” 
 THE “RC FISHING POLE IS PUSHED INTO THE HOLDERS 
AND CLIPS IN AUTOMATICALLY. IT IS FOR HOLDING THE 
FISHING LINE FROM THE FISHING ROD TO THE RC BOAT. 
 
  3.     ROUGH CONNECTORS, (Velcro dots) 
THE ROUGH CONNECTORS ARE ATTACHED TO THE END 
OF THE ”RC FISHING POLE”.  WHEN A SOFT CONNECTOR 
ON THE FISHING LINE TOUCHES IT, IT STICKS TOGETHER 
SO THE RC BOAT CAN TAKE THE FISHING LINE OUT. 
 
  4.     SOFT CONNECTORS, (Velcro dots) 
SOFT CONNECTORS ARE PUT ONTO THE FISHING LINE 
FROM THE FISHING  ROD. ONCE THE DEPTH OF THE LINE 
TO BE HUNG FROM THE RC BOAT IS DETERMINED, THE 
SOFT CONNECTOR IS SQUEEZED ONTO THE FISHING LINE 
AND FOLDED IN HALF OVER THE LINE.  THE FISHING LINE 
WITH THE SOFT CONNECTOR IS TOUCHED ONTO THE 
ROUGH  CONNECTOR ON THE END OF THE “RC FISHING  
POLE”. THEN THE BOAT IS READY TO DRIVE. 
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1. 

2. 

3. 

         Make sure the sides of the boat are clean of oil or  dirt for 
the  best bond when applying the holders on the boat.  For 
smaller boats the holders should be placed towards the middle to 
keep the boat balanced. On bigger boats you may apply the 
holders towards the rear of the boat. On other boats, or crafts  
there may be a more ideal to place the holders, such as the top, 
that's up to you. 
 
SEE FIGURE 1. 

            After locating the best spot for the holders, Peel off the pa-
per backing from each holder and press one firmly on both sides 
of the boat. 
 
SEE FIGURE 2. 

          After the holders are on the boat, push the  ends of the  
           “RC POLE” into each of the holders. 
 
SEE FIGURE 3. 

4. 
           Your boat should look like this now with the “RC POLE” at-
tached properly. 
 
SEE FIGURE 4. 

5. 
          Peel a round rough connecter and press it firmly on to the 
tip of the “RC POLE”. 
SEE FIGURE 5. 

  Now a round soft connecter goes on to the fishing line.  
         How far from the bait is up to you. Where you put it will be 
how much line is under the water. Peel off a round soft connecter 
and firmly fold it  over the fishing line.   
 
SEE FIGURE 6. 

6. 
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POSITION OF HOLDERS 

1. 

PEEL PAPER BACKING AND ATTACH 

2. 

3. 

INSERT ENDS OF “RC POLE” 

4. 

5. 

ROUGH CONNECTOR ON TIP 

6. 

 FOLD SOFT CONNECTOR OVER LINE 
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7. 

8. 

          You decide how much line you want hanging from the “RC 
POLE” by where you fold the soft connecter on the fishing line.  
SEE FIGURE 7. 

9. 

          Now push the soft -connecter from the fishing line on to the 
Rough -Connecter on the tip of the “RC POLE”. How hard you 
press it together will determine how easy it comes off when a fish 
hits. 
SEE FIGURE 8. 

          Now, if your fishing rod has a casting button push it, then  
use the remote controller to drive your line out to the fishing spot. 
If your rod has a bail cast, open it, then use the remote controller 
to  drive the line out. 
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8. 

9. 
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 PRECAUTIONS 
*Read the instructions carefully, and read the instructions that 
came with the boat or rc device that you use. 
 
*It is not wise to use the reverse gear on the boat while the fish-
ing line is attached, it could get tangled. 
 
*Avoid weedy areas, the boat could get stuck. 
 
*Avoid water conditions that are too rough, and windy conditions. 
 
* Children should not operate  the “RC FISHN’ POLE” unless un-
der adult supervision. 

LEGAL 
Laws vary from state to state, check to see if it is legal in your 
state to use “THE RC FISHING POLE”. 

    LIMITED WARRANTY  
 

The contents of this package have been quality control inspected 
and found free of any defects in material and workmanship. Ad-
ditionally, FISH FUN CO. offers the original customer a limited 
warranty and will replace or repair any product  found to be de-
fective providing it is returned prepaid to either the dealer from 
which it was purchased or directly to FISH FUN CO. in its origi-
nal package and in an unused state Defects resulting from mis-
use, abuse or accident are expressly excluded from coverage 
under this warranty.. This warranty is in lieu of all warranties, ex-
pressed or implied, including the implied warranty of merchant-
ability. Neither the seller nor manufacturer shall be liable for any 
loss or damage consequential or direct, arising from the use or 
inability to use this product. This includes any loss or damage to 
a remote control boat that arises or occurs with the use of The “ 
RC FISHING POLE”  This warranty applies only to The “RC 
FISHING POLE” , not the rc fishing boat. Some warranties for 
boats and rc devices exclude using the boat for anything other 
than its intended purpose. The warranty for the boat should be 
provided by the boat manufacturer. Since laws vary from state to 
state, the above exclusions may not pertain to you.             
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